

6



CITY OF SACRAMENTO

DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES

FACILITY MAINTENANCE DIVISION
FLEET MANAGEMENT DIVISION
RISK MANAGEMENT & INS. DIVISION
SUPPORT SERVICES DIVISION

OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR

September 27, 1985
SS:Admin:FM:MW:bb

APPROVED
BY THE CITY COUNCIL

OCT 8 1985

OFFICE OF THE
CITY CLERK

CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE
RECEIVED
OCT 2 1985

City Council
Sacramento, California

Honorable Members in Session:

SUBJECT: Recommendation of Award

SUMMARY

Attached is a tabulation of sealed proposals received by the City Clerk for furnishing materials in accordance with specifications adopted by the City Council.

RECOMMENDATION

It is recommended that the City Council accept the lowest responsive and responsible proposal submitted as follows:

<u>Bid No.</u>	<u>Bidder</u>	<u>Items Awarded</u>	<u>Contract Amount</u>
854 - 124 pair Leather Firefighter Safety Shoes (Attachment #1)	Butler's Uniforms 5600 H Street Sacramento, CA 95819 <u>(P.O. #60130)</u>	All	\$11,829.60

Sufficient funds are available to award the contract.

Respectfully Submitted,

Frank Mugartegui
Frank Mugartegui
Director of General Services

Recommendation Approved:

Walter J. Slipe
Walter J. Slipe
City Manager

1 Attachment

October 8, 1985
All Districts

ATTACHMENT #1

BID NO. 854 - FIREFIGHTER SAFETY SHOES

<u>Bidder</u>	<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Payment Terms</u>	<u>Comments</u>
Capital City Uniforms	\$10,508.63	2% 15 days	Vendor withdrew bid
Command Uniform	No Bid		
Solon Fire Control (Bid #1)	\$ 9,989.44	Net 30	Disqualified; shoe discontinued
(Bid #2)	\$12,881.12	Net 30	Disqualified; does not meet specifications
(Bid #3)	\$ 9,332.24	Net 30	Disqualified; does not meet specifications
Red Wing Shoe Store	\$10,120.88	Net 30	Disqualified; does not meet specifications
Shoe Emporium	\$16,167.12	Net 30	
Butler's Uniforms	<u>\$11,829.60</u>	Net 30	

Total Award of Contract To: Butler's Uniforms
5600 H Street
Sacramento, CA 95819

Total Amount of Contract: \$ 11,829.60

Original Estimated Cost: \$ 12,000.00

User: Fire Department

Due Date: September 3, 1985

October 15, 1985

Butler's Uniforms
5600 H St
Sacramento CA 95819

Dear Gentlemen:

On October 8, 1985, the Sacramento City Council accepted your bid in the amount of \$11,829.60 for Bid No. 854 - Firefighter Safety Shoes (P060130).

The City Support Services Administrator will contact you concerning the necessary contract.

Sincerely,

LORRAINE MAGANA, CITY CLERK

Connie Petersen
Deputy City Clerk

LM/mls/6

cc: Support Services Division

October 11, 1985

Solon Fire Control
13405 Folsom Boulevard
Folsom, CA 95630

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 854 - Firefighter Safety Shoes. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of October 8, 1985, to Butler's Uniforms in the amount of \$11,829.60.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

Janice Beaman
Deputy City Clerk

JB/dah/6

1941

1941

1941

1941

1941

1941

1941

1941

1941

October 11, 1985

Capitol City Uniforms
3260 J Street
Sacramento, CA 95816

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 854 - Firefighter Safety Shoes. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of October 8, 1985, to Butler's Uniforms in the amount of \$11,829.60.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

Janice Beaman
Deputy City Clerk

JB/dah/6

October 11, 1985

Red Wing Shoe Store
10695 Folsom Boulevard
Rancho Cordova, CA 95670

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 854 - Firefighter Safety Shoes. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of October 8, 1985, to Butler's Uniforms in the amount of \$11,829.60.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

Janice Beaman
Deputy City Clerk

JB/dah/6

1944

1944

1944

1944

1944

1944

1944

1944

October 11, 1985

Shoe Emporium
5663 Stockton Boulevard
Sacramento, CA 95824

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 854 - Firefighter Safety Shoes. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of October 8, 1985, to Butler's Uniforms in the amount of \$11,829.60.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

Janice Beaman
Deputy City Clerk

JB/dah/6

The first part of the document discusses the importance of maintaining accurate records of all transactions. It emphasizes that every entry should be supported by a valid receipt or invoice. This not only helps in tracking expenses but also ensures compliance with tax regulations.

In the second section, the author outlines the various methods used to collect and analyze data. These include direct observation, interviews, and the use of specialized software tools. Each method has its own strengths and limitations, and the choice of which to use depends on the specific requirements of the study.

The third section provides a detailed overview of the results obtained from the data analysis. It highlights several key findings that have significant implications for the field. For example, the data suggests that there is a strong correlation between the variables studied, which was not previously established.

Finally, the document concludes with a series of recommendations for future research. It suggests that further studies should be conducted to explore the underlying causes of the observed trends and to test the findings in different contexts.