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City Council
Sacramento, California

Honorable Members in Session:

SUBJECT: ADOPTION OF SPECIFICATIONS AND AWARD OF BID NO. 1777 FOR ASPHALT AND
AGGREGATE MATERIALS IN A TOTAL AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $900,000.00 PER
CONTRACT YEAR

LOCATION AND COUNCIL DISTRICT: City-wide; All districts

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommends that the City Council adopt specifications and accept the lowest responsible bids for the contracts

resulting from Bid No. 1777 for Asphalt and Aggregate Materials. Award is recommended to Teichert Aggregates
and Granite Construction in a total amount not to exceed $900,000.00 per contract year.

CONTACT PERSONS:

FOR COUNCIL MEETING: June 16, 1998
SUMMARY:

Attached is a tabulation of sealed proposals received by the City Clerk for furnishing material in accordance with
the specifications used in the bidding process, and recommendation for award of Bid No.1777 for Asphalt and
Aggregate Materials.

BACKGROUND:

This contract for asphalt and aggregate materials for street and road repairs will be used primarily by the Street
Division of the Department of Public Works. Various divisions within the Utilities Department also purchase
material off this contract.
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Recommendation for Award of Bid No. 1777
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Staff recommends that contracts be awarded to both Teichert Aggregates, 3500 American River Drive, Sacramento,
CA 95864, and Granite Construction, 3801 Power Inn Road, Sacramento, CA 95826, in a total amount not to exceed
$£900,000.00 per contract year. Theirs were the two lowest responsive bids received as shown in the attached bid
tabulation sheet. Teichert Aggregates’ plant is closest to the City Corporation Center-South. When City
transportation costs are factored, Teichert Aggregates becomes the lowest overall bidder, and as such, will be the
City’s primary source. Granite Construction will be used as a secondary or back-up source. Because the bid totals
represent those items selected for bid evaluation purposes only, staff recommends that the City Council authorize
contracts in a total amount not to exceed $900,000.00 per year, which more closely reflects the actual amount
anticipated to be expended each year of this potential five year contract.

FINANCIAL CONSIDERATIONS:

Sufficient funds have been budgeted by both the Department of Public Works and Ultilities Department for F'Y98/99
under Object Code 4472 for Asphalt and Quarry. -

ENVIRONMENTAL CONSIDERATIONS:

Ongoing administrative and maintenance activities, such as purchases of supplies, equipment or materials which
are not made for purposes of a public works construction project, do not constitute a "project” and are exempt from
the California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA). CEQA Guidelines, Sections 15061(b)(1), 15378(b)(3).

POLICY CONSIDERATIONS:

This recommendation is consistent with the requirements for competitive bidding as detailed in Title 57 of the
Sacramento City Code.

MBE/WBE EFFORTS:

There are no local M/WBE firms known or listed in the City Bid Directory that supply these construction materials.
It is necessary to buy locally, as these materials are purchased F.O.B. vendor’s plants and are picked up by various
City departmental personnel in City trucks. Soliciting bids and/or purchasing these materials outside the general
Sacramento area would not be economical or in the best interest of the City.

Respectfully Submitted,

Q/W,; T e dn

/ Robert B. Holbrook
’ It #% Procurement Services Manager
RECOMMENDATION APPROVED:

"By ey

WILLTAM H. EDGAR
City Manager
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BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
BID NO. 1777 - ASPHALT AND AGGREGATE MATERIALS
Totals, Teichert Granite Triangle RMC American Calmat Co./
Item Nos. Aggregates Construction Rock Products Lonestar River Asphalt Industrial Asphalt
1. $ 62,500.00 $ 60,000.00 $64,000.00 $56,500.00 No Bid No Bid
2. $ 6,25000 § 6,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3. § 142500 § 1,245.00 $ 1,297.50 $ 1,169.25 No Bid No Bid
4. $ 15,000.00 $ 16,500.00 No Bid No Bid $ 15,600.00 $ 18,000.00
5. $ 97,500.00 $ 97,500.00 No Bid No Bid $110,000.00 $110,000.00
6. $195,000.00  $197,500.00 No Bid No Bid $220,000.00 $230,000.00
7. $240,625.00  $240,625.00 No Bid No Bid $262,500.00 $275,000.00
8. $228,000.00  $222,000.00 No Bid No Bid $246,000.00 $252,000.00
9. No Bid $ 9,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10. § 1485000 $ 17,460.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11. $ 990000 $ 11,640.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12. $ 60,000.00 § 50,400.00 $ 55,200.00 $ 54,500.00 No Bid No Bid
13. No Bid $ 29,750.00 $29,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
BID NO. 1777 - ASPHALT AND AGGREGATE MATERIALS
Teichert Granite Triangle RMC American Calmat Co./
Aggregates Construction Rock Products Lonestar River Asphalt Industrial Asphalt

Prompt
Payment Not $.10 Per Ton
Discount Acceptable 2% - 20 Days - 20 Days None 2% - 20 Days None
City Tax ‘ :
Preference None - None None None None None
M/WBE No No  No No No No
Miles to
Base Point 1 6.0 9.0 : 15.5 13.5 19.8 8.0
Miles to
Base Point 2 5.0 11.0 14.5 18.3 21.7 12.0

Award of Contracts To: Teichert Aggregates Granite Construction

3500 American River Drive 3801 Power Inn Road
Sacramento, CA 95864 Sacramento, CA 95826
Original Estimated Cost: $900,000.00 Using Departments: Public Works/ Utilities
Total amount of Contracts: $900,000.00 Bid Due Date: May 13, 1998
Total No. of No. of M/WBE No. of M/WBE Award to
Bids Solicited Bids Solicited Responses M/WBE Vendor?

7 None Known or Listed 0 No



