CITY OF SACRAMENTO \ tES
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MAR 51980 HOWARD F. ISHIDA

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE

DIVISION OF PURCHASING PURCHASING AGENT
800 TENTH STREET SACRAMENTO, Ca 95814
SWTE 3 TELEPHONE (D16) 449.5342 March 3, 1980

City Council
Sacramento, California -

Honorable Members in Session:

SUBJECT: Recommendation of Award

SUMMARY

Attached is a tabulation of sealed proposals received by the City
Clerk for furnishing equipment in accordance with specifications
adopted by the City Council.

RECOMMENDATION

It is recommended that the City Council accept the lowest responsive
and responsible proposals submitted as follows:

Contract
Bid No. Bidder Items Awarded Amount
240 - Various Pinkerton Foundry Inc. 1, 2, and 7 $16,249.80
items of Cast 42 North Cluff Avenue
Iron Castings P. 0. Box 516
(Attachment 1) Lodi, CA 65240
P. 0. #4578]
Teichert Aggregates 3 and 4 $4,420.20
P. 0. Box 15002
Sacramento, CA 95813
P. 0. #45782
Forni Corparation . 5 and 6 $2,173.00

3600 Depot Road
Hayward, CA 94545
P. 0. #45783
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City Council -3- March 3, 1980

Sufficient funds are available to award the contracts.

Respectfully Submitted,

fioward F. Ishida

Purchasing Agent

Recommendation Approved:

J%

Walter J. Stipe
City Manager

HFI:jc
1 Attachment March 11, 1980



ATTACHMENT 1

BID NG, 240 - CAST IRON CASTINGS

Total Price Per Item - Including 6% Sales Tax

Bidder Ttem #1 Ttem #2 Ttem #3 Ttem #4  Items #5 X #6** Item #7 Discount
*Pinkerton Foundry Inc. $4,081.00 $?,420.00 $265.00  $8,480.00 $3,445.00 $4,748.80 -0-
Teichert Aggregates $4,664,00 $8,268.00 $180.20 $4,240.00 $2,517.50 $6,444 .80 5%
*Forni Corporation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid : $2!T?3700 No Bid -0-
*Neenah Foundry Company $5,538.50 $10,070.00 $3,773.60 $5,830.00 $4,425,50 $13,101.60 -0-
*Metalfab No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,950.00 No Bid No Bid 2%
*American Brass and Foundry Na 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,392,00%** -0~

. *These bidders certify that their company is in compliance with the voluntary wage/price standards set forth by the Fed-
eral Council on Wage and Price Stability.

**[tems #5 and #6 are grouped together because Item #6 consists of additional covers for Item #5,
***Dpes not meet specifications.

Total Award of Each Contract: Pinkerton Foundry Inc., - $16,249.80
' Forni Corporation - $2,173.00
Teichert Aggregates - $4,420.20
Total Award of A1l Contracts: $22,843.00
Estimated Cost: $23,000.00
User: Water and Sewer Division
Due Date: February 12, 1980



