

December 1, 1986

Sacramento County Auditor Controller
700 H Street, Room 4650
Sacramento, CA 95814

Madam:

On November 25, 1986, the Sacramento City Council adopted a resolution relative to demolition of dilapidated buildings for the addresses shown on the attached certified copy of said resolution.

If we can be of any further assistance to you, please feel free to call on us.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dah/16
Enclosure

cc: Revenue Division
Building Inspections
Finance Department

December 1, 1986

Equity Research
2041 Hallmark Drive
Sacramento, CA 95825

Dear Gentlemen:

On November 25, 1986, the Sacramento City Council took the following action(s) for property located at the south terminus of Carlin Avenue on west side of street: (P-84086)

1. Adopted Ordinance 86-112 rezoning the site to Single Family, R-1 zone.
2. Adopted Resolution 86-898 adopting Findings of Fact and approving the Tentative Map subject to conditions.

Enclosed, for your records, are fully certified copies of the above referenced documents.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dah/14

Enclosures

cc: Planning Department
Morton and Pitalo

November 26, 1986

Jenkins Machinery Co.
1848 Arnold Industrial Place
Concord, CA 94520

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 1026 - Groundskeeping machinery. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of November 25, 1986 and split in the following manner:

H.V. Carter, items 3, 5, 8, 9, 10 and 11, in the amount of \$58,419.78;

Duke Equipment and Irrigation, item 6, in the amount of \$609.50;

Weaver Equipment Co., item 1, in the amount of \$1,484.00;

Bliss Power Lawn, items 4 and 7, in the amount of \$4,183.46;

Edward R. Bacon Co., item 2, in the amount of \$9,645.86.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dbp/9C

November 26, 1986

Bishop Company
12519 E. Putnam Street
P.O. Box 870
Whittier, CA 90608

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 1026 - Groundskeeping machinery. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of November 25, 1986 and split in the following manner:

H.V. Carter, items 3, 5, 8, 9, 10 and 11, in the amount of \$58,419.78;

Duke Equipment and Irrigation, item 6, in the amount of \$609.50;

Weaver Equipment Co., item 1, in the amount of \$1,484.00;

Bliss Power Lawn, items 4 and 7, in the amount of \$4,183.46;

Edward R. Bacon Co., item 2, in the amount of \$9,645.86.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dbp/9C

November 26, 1986

Capital City Lawn & Power Equipment
2940 Freeport Blvd.
Sacramento, CA 95818

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 1026 - Groundskeeping machinery. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of November 25, 1986 and split in the following manner:

H.V. Carter, items 3, 5, 8, 9, 10 and 11, in the amount of \$58,419.78;

Duke Equipment and Irrigation, item 6, in the amount of \$609.50;

Weaver Equipment Co., item 1, in the amount of \$1,484.00;

Bliss Power Lawn, items 4 and 7, in the amount of \$4,183.46;

Edward R. Bacon Co., item 2, in the amount of \$9,645.86.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dbp/9C

November 26, 1986

Santa Rosa Fire Equipment
3445 Sebastopol Road
Santa Rosa, CA 95407

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 1021 - Fire hose. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of November 25, 1986 to L.N. Curtis and Sons in the amount of \$17,659.60.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dbp/9B

November 26, 1986

The Sherrill Company
5416 Celestial Way
Citrus Heights, CA 95610

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 1021 - Fire hose. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of November 25, 1986 to L.N. Curtis and Sons in the amount of \$17,659.60.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dbp/9B

November 26, 1986

Engineered Fire Equipment Co.
P.O. Box 4486
Burlingame, CA 94010

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 1021 - Fire hose. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of November 25, 1986 to L.N. Curtis and Sons in the amount of \$17,659.60.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dbp/9B

November 26, 1986

Halprin Supply Co.
3804 S. Broadway Place
Los Angeles, CA 90037

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 1021 - Fire hose. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of November 25, 1986 to L.N. Curtis and Sons in the amount of \$17,659.60.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dbp/9B

November 26, 1986

Bee Tee Engin Sales
21075 Alexander Court - Unit H
P.O. Box 3037
Hayward, CA 94540

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 1026 - Groundskeeping machinery. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of November 25, 1986 and split in the following manner:

H.V. Carter, items 3, 5, 8, 9, 10 and 11, in the amount of \$58,419.78;

Duke Equipment and Irrigation, item 6, in the amount of \$609.50;

Weaver Equipment Co., item 1, in the amount of \$1,484.00;

Bliss Power Lawn, items 4 and 7, in the amount of \$4,183.46;

Edward R. Bacon Co., item 2, in the amount of \$9,645.86.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dbp/9C

November 26, 1986

The Bob Randick Co., Inc.
1740 Leslie Street
P.O. Box 5048
San Mateo, CA 94402

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 1026 - Groundskeeping machinery. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of November 25, 1986 and split in the following manner:

H.V. Carter, items 3, 5, 8, 9, 10 and 11, in the amount of \$58,419.78;

Duke Equipment and Irrigation, item 6, in the amount of \$609.50;

Weaver Equipment Co., item 1, in the amount of \$1,484.00;

Bliss Power Lawn, items 4 and 7, in the amount of \$4,183.46;

Edward R. Bacon Co., item 2, in the amount of \$9,645.86.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dbp/9C

November 26, 1986

Sacramento Utilities Supply Company
P.O. Box 214125
Sacramento, CA 95821

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 1015 - Water meter fittings. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of November 25, 1986 and split in the following manner:

Grreat Distributing, Inc., items 18 through 49, in the amount of \$13,829.03;

Camellia Valley Supply, items 1 through 17 and 50 through 61, in the amount of \$41,306.37.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dbp/9A

November 26, 1986

Rockwell International
30 Globe Avenue
Texarkana, AR 75505

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 1015 - Water meter fittings. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of November 25, 1986 and split in the following manner:

Grreat Distributing, Inc., items 18 through 49, in the amount of \$13,829.03;

Camellia Valley Supply, items 1 through 17 and 50 through 61, in the amount of \$41,306.37.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dbp/9A

November 26, 1986

Familion Pipe & Supply
3985 Old 44 Drive
Redding, CA 96003

Gentlemen:

This is to inform you that you were not the successful bidder for Bid No. 1015 - Water meter fittings. The said bid having been awarded by the City Council at the regular meeting of November 25, 1986 and split in the following manner:

Grreat Distributing, Inc., items 18 through 49, in the amount of \$13,829.03;

Camellia Valley Supply, items 1 through 17 and 50 through 61, in the amount of \$41,306.37.

No bid security was required on the above bid.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dbp/9A

December 1, 1986

Grreat Distributing, Inc.
P. O. Box 4025
Redding, CA 96099

Dear Gentlemen:

On November 25, 1986, the Sacramento City Council accepted your bid in the amount of \$13,829.03 for Items 18-49, 62-69, 72-75; Bid No. 1015 - Water Meter Fittings.

The City Support Services Administrator will contact you concerning the necessary contract.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dah/9

December 1, 1986

Camellia Valley Supply
8732 Fruitridge Road
Sacramento, CA 95826

Dear Gentlemen:

On November 25, 1986, the Sacramento City Council accepted your bid in the amount of \$41,306.37 for Items 1-17, 50-61; Bid No. 1015 - Water Meter Fittings.

The City Support Services Administrator will contact you concerning the necessary contract.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dah/9

December 1, 1986

L. N. Curtis & Sons
4133 Broadway
Oakland, CA 94611

Dear Gentlemen:

On November 25, 1986, the Sacramento City Council accepted your bid in the amount of \$17,659.60 for Bid No. 1021 - Fire Hose.

The City Support Services Administrator will contact you concerning the necessary contract.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dah/9

December 1, 1986

H. V. Carter Co., Inc.
2309 Lexington Street
Sacramento, CA 95815

Dear Gentlemen:

On November 25, 1986, the Sacramento City Council accepted your bid in the amount of \$58,419.78 for Items 3, 5, 8, 9, 10 & 11; Bid No. 1026 - Groundskeeping Machinery.

The City Support Services Administrator will contact you concerning the necessary contract.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dah/9

December 1, 1986

Weaver Equipment Co.
2850 El Centro
Sacramento, CA 95833

Dear Gentlemen:

On November 25, 1986, the Sacramento City Council accepted your bid in the amount of \$1,484.00 for Item 1; Bid No. 1026 - Groundskeeping Machinery.

The City Support Services Administrator will contact you concerning the necessary contract.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dah/9

December 1, 1986

Duke Equipment & Irrigation
2344 Auburn Blvd.
Sacramento, CA 95821

Dear Gentlemen:

On November 25, 1986, the Sacramento City Council accepted your bid in the amount of \$609.50 for Item 6; Bid No. 1026 - Groundskeeping Machinery.

The City Support Services Administrator will contact you concerning the necessary contract.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dah/9

December 1, 1986

Bliss Power Lawn Equipment Co.
101 Commerce Circle
Sacramento, CA 95815

Dear Gentlemen:

On November 25, 1986, the Sacramento City Council accepted your bid in the amount of \$4,183.46 for Items 4 & 7; Bid No. 1026 - Groundskeeping Machinery.

The City Support Services Administrator will contact you concerning the necessary contract.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dah/9

December 1, 1986

Edward R. Bacon Co.
8766 Fruitridge Road
P. O. Box 26231
Sacramento, CA 95826

Dear Gentlemen:

On November 25, 1986, the Sacramento City Council accepted your bid in the amount of \$9,645.86 for Item 2; Bid No. 1026 - Groundskeeping Machinery.

The City Support Services Administrator will contact you concerning the necessary contract.

Sincerely,

Lorraine Magana
City Clerk

LM/dah/9