PROOF OF PUBLICATION

STATE OF CALIFORNIA

COUNTY OF SACRAMENTO

HEATHER BRANTLEY

CITY OF SACRAMENTO
CITY CLERK
9151STHCH 5TH FLR
SACRAMENTO CA 95814

ORDINANCE

IN LIEU OF PFP 02023-0014 ITEM 02 2023-00983
01412

HEARING/CLOSE/SALE DATE: 08/01/23

The undersigned says:

I am over the age of 18 years and a citizen of the United
States. I am not a party to and have no interest in this
matter. I am a principal clerk of the SACRAMENTO
BULLETIN*, a newspaper of general circulation in the
City of Sacramento, Sacramento Public Notice District,
the County of Sacramento, and the State of California, as
adjudicated in Sacramento Superior Court Case No.
00SCO01155. The notice, a printed copy of which appears
hereon, was published on the following date(s): Aug 7,
2023

1 declare under penalty of petjury that the foregoing is
true and correct. Executed at Los Angeles, California on

08/07/23.

signature

Sacramento Bulletin
530 Bercut Dr
Ste E
Sacramento Ca 95814
Phone: 916-445-6825
Fax: 916-443-5871

Cust. Num.: 015572 Control Num.: 998969

Cust. Ref. Num.: PO71367 OO

Page 1 of 1



SACRAMENTO BULLETIN AND SPECTRUM

MONDAY, AUGUST 7, 202

ORDINANCE 2023-0014 105.5.31 H1
Adopted by the Sacramento City Councll ~ - 105534 T
August 1,.2023 105.5.35 H1
An Ordinance Deletmg and Adding Chapter 15.36 of the Sacramento City Code, _ 105.5.48 ]
Relating to Adoption of-the 2022 California Fire Code with Local Amendments, and -
Declarmg the Ordinance to be an Emergency Measure to Take Effect ] y 105.5.55 H1
Upon Adoption ’ T -+ R
BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO: 105.5.57 H1
SECTION 1. 105.5.58 ) H1
In connection with the local amendments -enacted within Sacramento City Code section 105.5.59 H1
15.36.050 and pursuant to California Health and Safety Code sections 17958.5; 17958.7, - <
and 18941 5 the City Council finds and detérmines that:~ 105-5-5'3~ -H1 .
A. The changes fo the requirements published in the California Building Standards Code ~ [105.5.61 H1
and other regulations adopted by the State of California are reasonably r y -
because of local climatic, topographical, or geological conditions. - ) 107.2.1 G2
B. - Under ttis adopting ordinance, specific amendments have been established that are i09.6 1G6, H3, 11,12, 13
more restrictive in nature than those adopted by the State of California under the T
State Buildings Standards Code and the State Housing & Community Deveiopment
Codes, commonly referred to as titie 24 and title 25 of the California Code of Re: 8ula— 111 (G6, H3, 13
tions, respectlvely These amendments to the 2022 edition of the California Fire Code
are reasonably necessary to address the fire problems, concerns, and future direction 113.1 G5, GB, H1, H2. 11, 12. I3
by which the city can establish and maintain an environment that will afford a level of T ]
fire and life safety to all who live and work W|th|n the city.- Chapter 2 5
C." The International Code Council has assumed responsibility for the Internatiorial Fire Definitions L
Code and International Fire Code Standards. The Internatiorial Code Council provid- 307.4.2 G5, GB, H3
ed a means for participation by all code enforcement officials from throughout the . R s
country, as well as industry representatives, consultants, and other private parties _
with an interest in the International Fire Code. 1308.1.6.3 G5, G6, H3
D. The 2021 edition of the International Fire Code published by the International Code
Council is a nationally recognized compilation of proposed rules, regulations, and 311.22 G1, G2, G5, G§, 13
standards. .
: 311.3 G1, G2, G5, G6, 13
E. . The International Fire Code has been printed in book form and published as a Code B
within the meaning of California Government Code section 50022.1. B11.4 &1, G2, G5, GB, 13
F.  Under the provisions of California Health and Safety Code section 18941.5, local,
amendments may be made based en climatic, topographical, and geological condi- . [311.5 G1, G2, G5, G6, 13
tions. The’1 ﬁr:dlngls of fact conrt]au;]ed t}:erem ad(lirelss each of tétese condmonsd agd
present the local situation, which either singularly or in combination, caused the 5.
amendments enacted within section 15.36.050 to be adopted. 311.5.1 1, G2, 5, GS’ B
G. CLIMATIC ) 311.5.2 G1, _GZ, G5, G6, I3
1. [G1] Climate is one of the greatest impacts to fire behavior and other major emer- 1311.5.3 61, G2 G8, |
gerécyf/u events because it cannot be controlled. The drying out of wood shakes and wild G1, G2, GS, 66, 3
fand fuels in the summer months allows for easy ignition. . B1isa G162, G5, G, 13
2. [G2] The burldmg of homes within weed-covered rural areas and the cormbustible
‘weeds on vacant urban lots, coupled with windy conditions, is a recipe for disaster. 1311.5.5 G1, G2, G5, G8, I3
Sacrar?eﬂto has four distinct seasons: sumrger wmterdfall and spr|nghThe d|gt|nc— P
tions of these seasons are an attraction to the area and one reason why significant -
-population growth has oecurred. The population growth has impacted emergency 311.6 6G2,G5, G6, H1, H2, H3
service levels causing a strain on emergency services, and the resuit is increased
response times. 503.1° G2, G3, G4, G, H1, H2; 12,13
3. [G3] Sacramento has significant variations in weather patterns. Summers are arid and ;
warm, winters are cool fo freezing, and fall and spring can bring any combination of \503-1 A G2, G3, G4, G6, H1, H2, 12, 13
weather patterns together. It is this cyclical uncertainty that allows weather events
such as the rapid melting of the snowpack that causes flooding in the low-lying valley - 503.1.2 G2, G3, G4, G6, H1, H2, 12, I3
a;eas of Sacramjrgto As nverif rise gn_ldhfall wng the nf.moff access io common areas -
of recreation and boating is affecte e doubling of average rainfall calied an “El -
Nino™ event has occurred from time to-time and may cause the grass to mature and. l5°3'1'3 G.z' G3, G4, GB, H1, H2, 12,13
grow in excess of six feet high before it dries out. Ten square feet of land with thls type -
of fuel is equivalent to the explosive force of one gallon of gasoline.” 03.2 G2, G3, G4, GB, H1, H2, 12, I3
4, [G4] Average yearly rainfall is approximately 19 inches. This rainfall normally occurs -
from-October fo Apfil. Low-level fog (Tule.fog).Is present throughout the wintermonths; - Fos 2 1‘ GZ G3 G4 G, H1, H2, 2.8
which may bring visibility to almost zero feet. The fog delays emergency résponders
and has caused numerous vehicle accidents including the incident on December 11, 03.2.2 GZ G3 G4, G8, H1, H2, 12, I3
1997 on Interstate 5 in Eik Grove that involved 36 vehicles and .caused 31 casualties
including & fatalities. The fog can also cause freezing and slick roadways. 03.2.3 GZ GS GAGBHLH2 213
5. [G5] During the summer months there is generally no measurable precipitation. Tem- . _
peratures for this dry period range from 70 to 116 degrees Fahrenheit and are fre- 503.2.4 G2, G3, G4, G6, H1, H2, 12, I3
quently achcompamefd by light to gusty Delta winds. The relative humidity during sum; :
mer months range from 2% to 30%, which is arid. The city contains many acres o 3 -
grasslands, which, in conjunction with the dry and windy conditions, create a haz- l503.2.5 G2, G3, G4, G6, H1, H2, 12, 13
ardous situation that has led to extensive grass and brush fires in recent years. More L —
development is extending from the urban core into the grass-covered areas. Wind-dri- 03.2.6 G2, G3, G4, GB, H1, H2,12, 13
ven fires have led to serious consequences in similar areas of the state. ;o ' i
6. [Gg] In th;] past, 'Isegleral téonsecutlrveEa yea‘rsd of dtrought ccﬁndrtronrsa have och:urre]d thuﬁ 03.2.7. . [32. G3, G4, G6, H1, H2, lv2,v'l 3
reducing the available water-supply. Ground water as well as surface supplies have al -
been affected. The drought condltlgns have led to lower water tables, reduced fire flow ’503-2-3 G2, G3, G4, G6, H1, H2, 12, I3
testing, water contamination, and water conservation efforts. Additionally, demands on -
water systems have increased due to extreme population growth. These impacts have 03.3 162, G3, G4, GB, H1, H2, 12, I3
ne%atlvel); mpactgd watt%r use arrtt;l e%vgllaé)ll#ty for tth?:t fire serv1cel Th?i degradation of :
water systems reduces the quality of fixed fire protection, as well as fire suppression
activities. Some water purveyors have reduced the standard pressure maintained F°3-4 G2, G3, G4, G6, H1, H2, 12, 13
withiri their ‘systems. This change will make many fire protection systems ineffective - .
and corrective measures such as adding pressure and increasing necessary booster 03.4.1 G2, G3, G4, G6, H1, H2, 12, I3
pumps will be required at great cost to the conmimunity.
H. TOPOGRAPHICAL ) 03.5 G2, G3, G4, G6, H1, H2, 12, I3
1. [H1] Sacramento is bisected by several topographical features, including major rivers, ]
minor rivers, creeks, agueducts, lakes, sloughs, natural parkways; open space, F03'5'1 G2, G3, G4, Gs' H1,H2,12, 13
bridges, overpasses, freeways, railroad tracks including light rail, drainage canals, : -
sprawling industrial facilities 'such as Proctor & Gamble, and a former army depot. 503.5.2 G2, G3, G4, G6, H1, H2, 12, I3
;I'raff‘ ic hﬁs ;o be channe}fed around severaldv.)(fj tl'lrese topographical features _Iarrltd ler;Iia— Co .
fons, which creates traffic congestion and delays emergency response. These fea- -
tures are located between many of the fire stations located within Sacramento. With _03'6 G2, G3, G4, G5, H1, H2, 12, 13
the OSHA ““two-in, two-out™ rule requiring two fire fighters ready to make fire attack —
‘only when two others are present, it is imperative that no, delays affect the timely 05.1 G2, G3, G4, G6, H1, H2, 12, 13
response of fire fighters. .
2. '[H2] Heavy traffic congestion on the City's major streets already acts as a barrier to 05.1.1 G2, G3, G4, G6, H1, H2, 12,13
timely response for fire and emergency vehicles. Some roadways are expected to
double their traffic flow within the next 10 years. In the event of an accident’or ather 05.1.2 G2, G3, G4, GB, H1, H2, 12, 13
emergency at one of the key points of intersection betwsen a road and river or free- - -
way, sections of the City could be isolated, or response time could be sufficiently . (595,13 G2, G3, G4, GB, H1, H2, 12, 13
slowed so as to increase the risk of injury or damage. x _
3. - [H3] Preservation of wetland areas, natural parkways, riparian corridors along - lﬁ07-5-1 G2, G3, G4, G6, H1, H2, 12,13
rivers/streams, vernal pools, open space, endangered species habitat, and other '
exemptions from vegetation abatement programs have all contributed to access prob- 511.1-511.9 H1
lems. These situations, though environmentally important, increase the demands:on l - B .
the fire service due to the extreme fire hazard created by fuel. loading and lrmrted =
access. 02 G2, G6, H1, 13
. GEOLOGICAL . 903.2 1G1,G6, H1, H2, 11,13, 14
1. . [I1] Sacramento is made of several unique communmes The seamless fire protechon -
efforts provided through “automatic aid™ agreements allow for each community '903 2417 IG3, G6, H3, 2
support each.other, but this also reduces coverage of fire stations during tlrst—
response and multlple response incidents. A first alarm assignment draws two, fire 903.3.1.3 H1, 1, 13, 14
engines and one ladder truck, emptying up to three fire stations. A home as littie as
1,500 square feet can draw a second alarm assignment in some instances.This could -
take out of service as much as six fire stations. This situation would cause a " move- ’903'3-8-4 H1, H2, H3, I3
* of other fire stations to cover the empty stations. Thus, many fire stations could o . :
ultimately be affected for a second alarm assrgnment/dlspatch If the situation is exac- 903.4.1.1 G1, G2, 11
erbated, for example, through simultaneous calls or events, long term commitments. -
to emergencies, station brown-outs, or out-of-service emergency- -vehicles, then 907.23 G162 1
extended response times will occur. ) o ]
2. [I2] Located at the confluence of two major rivers within California’s Central Valley, the 07.6.6 : G1,G2, 1
City of Sacramenio has experienced seasonal flooding. Intricate levee systems were :
created to hold back floodwaters; however, development has moved info areas that 07.6.6 (A - &1 G2 1
have the potential for floading. Flooding and the resultant water infrusion into buildings [9 £8(A) 134
can incapacitate building fire protection systems, in addition to taxing the emergency
fesponse capabilities should evacuation and rescue become necessary. 907.6.6 (B} G1, G2, 11
. 3. [i8] The neighborhoods within the. City have a propensity to be distinct in many ways -
: due to geographical and geological features sgch as freeways, rivers, etc. Neighbor- 907.6.6 (C) G1,62,1
hoods such as the Pocket Area, Natomas, and River Park each have factors timiting
access to them. Some nexghborhoods are more subject to urbanization than others,  907.6.6.1.1 G1, G2, 11
and some are targets for revitalization, Intensive use of land in urban areas means
bigger buildings, which create complex problems for fire safety. Chapter 11 13 H3
J. - Based on tooographrcal and geological conditions,. the local amendments enacted - ~
within section 15.36.070 are reasonable and necessary pursuant to California Health 1101.3 H1, H3, G6
and Safety Code section 18941.5. Whilg it is clearly understood that the adoption of - ,
such amendments may not prevent the incidence of fire, these amendments attempt*  [T5a435 HT H3.G8
o reduce the Severity and potentral loss of life and property, and enhance protection R PR
of the environment. B
12006.5.14 G2, H1, 11
K.© California Health and Safety Code section 17958.7 requires that the modifications or i
change be expressly marked and identified as to which each finding refers. The fol- 15603.3 G2, H1. 11
lowing table provides the code sections that have been modified which are “building : HE
standards™ as defined in California Health and Safety Code section 18909, and the _
associated conditions for modlﬁcatlon due to local climatic, geologlcal and topograph- 601.2 H1
ical reasons.
Local Amendments to the California Fire Code FGM'? (52, H2, 13
- _ : 15704.2.14.1 G2, H1, 11
Section Number Local Climatic/Geological/Topographical Condition - R
Chapter 80 H1
104.2.1 . G2, I3 e B AN
104.3.2 ] G2, H2. 13 ‘Ic104.2 © G2, G3,G4, GB, HT, H2, 12,13
104.7.2 : G2, H2, 13 - C104.3 G2, G3, G4, G6, H1, H2, 12, 13 -
105.5.29 1 c163.4 G2,G3,G4,G6, A1, H2, 2,3

C104.5

G2, G3, G4, GB, H1 H2 12, I3

'Table C¢195.1 ) G2; G3, G4 G86, H1 H2 B

- [Footnotes Table |G2, G3, G4, GB, H1, H2, 12, 13
_jlcc105.1

SECTION 2.

Chapter 15.36 of the Sacramento City Code is hereby deleted
SECTION 3.

Chapter 15.36 is hereby added to the Sacramento C|ty Code to read as follows
Chapter 15.36 2022 CALlFORNIA FIRE CODE
15.36.010 Adoption of the 2022 Callfornla Flre Code.
The 2022 California Fire Code (Part 9 of the 2022 Calrforma Buxldlng Standard
Code, Title 24, California Code of Regulations). is hereby adopted by referenc
and incorporated into this code except as expressly supsrseded, amended or ng
adopted by the local amendments st forth in thns chapter

15.36.020 Short title.

This chapter shall be known and may be cited ‘as the “fire prevention code.™

- 15.36.030 Definitions. -

tive

“'Fire code official” means the fire chief or the fire chief's desigriated representa

15.36.040 Penaities.

Any violations of this chapter are pumshable in the same manner as set forth i
section 15.04.060.

15.36.050 Local amendments to the 2022 Caleorma F're Code

The 2022 California Fire Code (Ti itle 24, Part 9 of the California Code of Ftegula
-tions) is-amended as set forth in this sect|on i

A.
Al

5.

Chapter 1, Scope and Administration, is amended as follows: )
Section 104.2.1 is added to read 'as follows:

-104,2.1 Approved fire plans. Any work requiring-fire department inspec
tion and approval shall have available on site an approved set of construc
tronkdocuments that allow the ﬁre cade ofﬁmal to review for inspaction o
worl i

Section 104.3.2 is added to read as follows

104.3.2 Cltatlons ‘and administrative penaltles The fire code officia

> may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this chap
ter in accordance with Sacramento City Code section 1.28.020 .and ma
issue an order imposirig-administrative penaltres pursuant to Sacrament
City Code section 1.28.010-

Section 104.7.2 is added to-read as follows;

104.7.2 Contract inspector. The fire code official may require the owne
or the person in possession or control of the building or premises to pro
vide, without charge to.the fire department, a special inspector (" conirac
inspector‘-‘:); when the department has no technical expertise available
conduct the required inspections. The contract inspector shall be a quali
fied person who shall demonstrate his,or her competence to the satisfac
tion of the fire code official. The fire code official-shall establish policie:
and procedures to be followed by the contract mspec‘tor for the duratlon [o
the contracied duties. :

Section 105.5.29 is amended to read as follows: -
105.5.29 LP-gas. An operational permit is required for:
1. Storage and use of LPG. h
Exception: A permit is not required for individual container.
with a 500-gallon (1893L) water capacity or less or multipl
container systems having an aggregate quantity no
- exceeding 500 gallons (1893L) serving occupancies ir
Group R-3.
2. Operation of cargo.tankers that transport LP-gas.

Section 105.5.31 is amended to read as follows

ER

" 105.5.31 Mlscellaneous combustlble storage An operatlonal permlt it

required to store, in any. building or upon.any premises, combustible empt
packing cases, pallets, boxes, barrels, or similar containers, rubber tires, rub
ber, cork or similar combustrble material, in excess of 1,500 cubic fee
(457 200 mm) gross volume.

Section 105.5.34 is amended to read as follows: )

105.5.34 Open burning. An operational permit is required to ignite.or main
tain a fire on.any public property, or on private property without the expres:
peimission of the lessee or property owner. Instructions and stlpulatrons 0
the' permlt shall be adhered to.

Section 105.5.35 is amended to read as follows:

105.5.35 Open flames and torches. An operational permit is requlred 1
remove palnt with a torch; or to.use a torch or open-ﬂame devnce in a wildfire
risk area. .

Section 105.5.48 is amended to read as follows: -

105.5.48 Storage of scrap tires and tire byproducts. An operational permi
is required to estabfish, conduct or maintain storage of scrap_tires and {ire
byproducts exceeding 1 ,500 cubic feet (457 200 mm) ot total volume,
Section 105.5.55 is added to read as follows ’ '

105.5.55 Apartments. An operatxonal permlt is reqmred for apartment:
and/or complexes exceeding three units. .

Section 105.5.56 is added to read as follows:

. 105.5.56 Battery systems. An operational permit is requrred for the use an«

11.

12,

13

14.

15.

storage, within buildings, of battery systems having a liquid eapacity of more
than 50 gallons.

R Section 105.5.57 is added to read as follows: .

105.5.57 Day care facilities. An operatlonal permlt |s required for a commer
cial day.care facility. - - .

Sectlon 105.5.58 is added to tead as follows:

105.5.58 Hotels and motels An operatloual permit is requrred forthe use o

ahotel or motel. -

Section 105:5.59 is added fo read as tollows:

105.5.59 Instltutlons An operatlonal permrt is required for the use of ar
“institution™ as defined by Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations.

Section 105.5.60 is added fo read as follows: -

105:5.60 Marinas. An operational permit is requxred for the use of a marina

Section 105.5.61 is added to read as follows

. 105.5.61 Ftadloac'hve materials. An operational permit is reqmi'ed for the

16.

17,

use or storage of any amount of materials capable of producmg beta o
gamma radiation.

Section 107 2.1 is added to read as toltows

107.2.1 Administrative costs. The' authonty having Jurlsdlctron may bilt ¢
contractor for cost recovery for time spent at the test/inspection site as wel
as administrative costs. .

Sectron 100.61s added to read as follows

109.! 60vercrowdmg Overcrowding or admrttance of any person beyond the

- approved -capacity of a building or:a portion thereef is prohibited. The: fire

18.
19.

code official, on finding any overcrowding conditions or-obstructions in aisles
passageways, or other means of e%ress or on finding -any condition that con:
stitutes a life-safety hazard, is -authorized to cause the event to be stoppex
untrl such condmon or obstructlon is corrected

Sectlon it is not adopted -
Sechon 118,118 amended to read as follows:

'113.1 Authority to dlsconnect service utilities. The fire code ofﬁcxal shal
have the authority to authorize disconnection of wtility service to the building
structure or system in order to safely execute emergency operations or f¢
eliminate-an.immediate hazard. The fire code official shall nolify the serving
utility and, where possible, the owner or the owner’s authorized agent and thé
occupant: “of the building, structure or service system of the decision to dis
connect prior to taking such action. if not notified prior o disconnection, ther
the owner, the owners authorized agent or.occupant of the building, structur
or service system shall be notified in writing as soon as practlcal thereafier.

B. Section 202, General Definitions, is amended as follows.

1.

The définition of “electronic momto_nng 'system is added to read as follows



. MONDAY, AUGUST 7, 2023

SACRAMENTO BULLETIN AND SPECTRUM

C.

Chapter 3, General Requirements, is amended as follows:

1.

o

11.

—

ELECTRONIC MONITORING SYSTEM. “"Electronic monitoring system™
means an approved method to electronically detect and fransmit, to an
approved alarm service provider's Type A (listed) Central Station, information
indicating that the automatic fire sprinkler system or electronic fire detection
system has been activated and to relay the alarm to eithier (a) the Sacramen-
10 Regional Fire/EMS. Communications Center, or (b) the Sacramento Inter-
national Airport Communication Center. . . .

The definition of “false alarm™ is amended to read as follows:

FALSE ALARM. False alarm™™ has the same definition as “false fire alarm™
as set forth in Sacramento City Code section 8.38.030:

The definition of “qualified aitendant™ is added to read as follows:

QUALIFIED ATTENDANT. " Qualified attendant™ means an individual that
has been trained.in the proper methods of the handling, storage and dispens-
ing of any material, product or substance regulated by the code. These shall
include, but not be limited to ammonia, chlorine,.cryogenic fluids, flammable
and combustible liquids and gases. The attendant must be able to demon-
strate to the satisfaction of the fire code official that he or she possesses ade-
quate knowledge in the subject area. B .

The definition of “recreational fire™ is amended to read as follows:

RECREATIONAL FIRE. An outdoor fire burning materials. other than rubbish
where the fuel being burned is not contained in an incinerator, outdoor fire-
place, portable outdoor fireplace, barbeque grill or barbeque pif and has a
total fuel area of 3 feet (914 mm) or less in diameter and 2 feet (610 mm) or
less in height for pleasure, religious, ceremonial, cooking, warmth, or similar
purposes.

Section 307.4.2 is added to read as follows:

307.4.2 Recreational fires. Recreational fires shall not be conducted within
25 feet (7620 mm) of a structure or combustible material. Conditions that could
cause a fire to spread within 25 feet (7620 mm)_of a structure shall be elimi-
nated prior to ignition. :

Section 308.1.6.3 is added to read as follows:

308.1.6.3 Sky lanterns. The use of sky' lanterns or other-similar devices is pro-
hibited. . - o L C

Section 311.2.2 is added to read as follows:

311.2.2 Fire proteétioh. Fire protection systems shall be maintained in an
operable condition at all times.

Exceptions: -

1L ‘Where the premises have been cleared of all combustible materials
and debris and, in the opinion of the fire code official, the type of con-
struction, fire separation distance and security of the premises do not
create a fire hazard.

2. - Where approved by the fire code. official, buildings that will not be

heated and where fire protection systems will be exposed to freezing

- temperatures, fire alarm and automatic sprinkler systems are permit-

ted to be placed out of service and standpipes are permitted to be

maintained as dry systems (without an automatic water supply), pro-

vided that the building does not have coptents or storage, and win-

dows, doors and other openings are secured to prohibit entry by unau-
thorized persons. L

3., Where approved by the fire code official, fire alarm and automatic

sprinkler systems are permitted to be’placed out of service in season-

< - .. -ally occupied buildings that will not be héated; where fire protection

' .« systems will be exposed fo freezing temperatures; where fire areas do

- -not exceed 12,000 square feet. (1115 m2); and that do not store motor
-vehicles or hazardous materials. :

"4 section 311.3 is added o read as follows: _

311.3 Removal of combustibles. Persons owning, or in charge or control of,
a vacant building or portion thereof, shall remove therefrom all accumulations
of combustible materials, flammiable or combustible waste or rubbish, and shali
securely lock or otherwise secure doors, windows, and other openings to pre-
vent entry by unauthorized persons. The premises shall be maintained clear of
waste or hazardous materials.

- Exceptions:

1. Buildings or portions of buildings undergoing additions, alterations,
repairs, or change of occupancy in accordance with the California

- Building Code, where waste is controlled and removed as required by -

Section 304.

_ 2. Seasonally occupied l‘)’uilgiiﬁ_gs‘.‘

Y

*Section 311.4 is added 16 réad as follows: " -

311.4 Removal of hazardous materials. Persons owning or having charge or
control of a vacant building containing hazardous materials regulated by Chap-
ter 50 shall comply with the facility closure requirements of Section 5001.6.

Section 311.5 is added to read as follows:

311.5 Placards. Any vacant or abandoned buiidings or structures determined
to be unsafe pursuant to Section 110 of this code relating to structural or inte-
rior hazards shall be marked as required by Sections 311.3.1 through 311.5.5.

Section'311.5.1 is added to read as foliows: ‘
"311.5.1 Placards location: Placards shall be applied on the front of the struc-
‘ture and be visible from the street. Additional placards shall be applied to the
side of each entrance to the structure and on penthouses.

Section 311.5.2'is added to read as follows:”

“811.5.2 Placard size-and célof. Placards shall be 24 inches by 24 inches (610
" mm by 610 mm) miriirunt in size with a red background, white reflective stripes
and a white reflective border. The stripes and border shall have a 2-inch (51

mm) minimum stroke.

Section 311.5.3 is added to read as follows:

311.5.1 Placard date, Placérds shall bear the date of their application to the
building and the date of the most recent inspection.

. Section 311.5.4 is added to read as follows:

311.5.4 Placard symbois. The design of the placards shall use the following
symbols: '

1. - This symbol éha’ll mean that the structure had normal structural condi-
tions at the time of marking: .

2. This symbol shall mean that structural or interior hazards exist, and inte-
rior firefighting or rescue operations should be conducted with extreme
caution. . . . -

3. - This symbol shail mean that structural or interior hazards exist to a
degree that consideration should be given to limit firefighting to exterior
operations only; with entry only occurring for known life hazards.

4. Vaéant marker hazard identification symbols: The following symbols shall
He used to designate known hazards on the vacant building marker. They
shall be placed directly above the symbol. :

4.1. B/O-Roof open

4.2, S/M-Stairs, steps, and landing missing

4.3. F/E-Avoid fire escapes .
-~ 4.4. H/F-Holes in floor

Section 311.5.5 is added to read as follows:

311.5.5 lnformatiohal use. The use of these symbols is informational only and
shall not in any way limit the discretion of the on-scene incident commander.

12, Section 311.6 is added to read as follows:

311.6 Unoccupied tenant spaces in mall buildings. Urioccupie& tenant
spaces in covered and open mall buildings shall be:

1.- Kept free frd[n the storage of any maiterials.

2. Separated from the remainder of the building by partitions of not less '

than 0.5-inch-thick {12.7 mm} gypstim board or an approved equiva-
lent to the underside of the ceiling of the adjoining tenant spaces.

3. - Without doors of other access openings other than one door that shail
be kept key locked in the ¢iosed position except during that time when
opened for inspection. : :

4. Keptrfrée froh combustible waste and be broom-swept clean.

D. Chapter 5, Fire Service Features, is amended as follows:

1. Section 503.1 is amended to read as follows:

503.1 Where required. Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided
and maintained in accordance with Sections 503.1.1 through 503.1.3.

2] Section 503.1.1is amended to read as follows:

* 503.1.1 Buildings and facilities. Approved fire apparatus access
roads shall be provided for every facility, building or portion of a build-
ing hereafter constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction. There

- fire apparatus access road shall comply with the requirements of this
section and shall extend tq within 150 feet (45,720 mm) of all portions
of the facility and all portions of the exterior walls of the first story of
the building as measured by an approved route and around the exte-
rior of the' building or facility.

Exceptions:

1. The fire code official is authorized to increase the dimension of 150 feet
(45,720 mm) where any of the following conditions occur: .

1.1 The building is equipped throughout with an approved automatic
sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section-903.3.1.1,
903.3.1.2 or 803.3.1.3.

1.2 Fire apparafus access roads cannot be installed because of
location on property, topography, waterways, nonnegotiable
grades or other similar conditions, and an approved aiternative
means of fire protection is provided. -

1.3  There are not-more than two Group R-3 or Group U occupancies.

Where approved by the fire code official, fire apparatus access roads are per-

. mitted to be exempted or modified for solar photovoltaic power generation

facilities.
Section 503.1.2 is amended to read as follows:

503.1.2 Additional access. The fire code official is authorized to require
more than one fire apparatus access road based on the potential for impair-
ment of a single road by vehicle congestion, condition of terrain, climactic
conditions or other factors that could limit access.

Section 503.1.3 is amended to read as follows:

503.1.3 High-piled storage. Fire department vehicle ag:céss to buildings
used for high-piled combustible storage shall comply with the applicable pro-
visions of Chapter 32. .

Section-503.2 is amended to read as follows: .

503.2 Specifications. Two fire apparatus access roads shall be provided in
accordance with Sections 501 and 503 for every facility, building, subdivision,
development, campus, or complex, containing 40 or more residential units
within the jurisdiction. Fire apparatus access roads shall be installed and
arranged in accordance with Sections 503.2.1 through 503.2.8.

[California Code of Regulations, Title 19, Division 1, 3.05(a)] Fire Depértment

Access and Egress. (Roads)

(@) Roads. Required access roads from every building to a public street
shall be all-weather hard-surfaced (suitable. for use. by fire apparatus)
right-of-way not less than 20 feet in width. Such right-of-way shall be
unobstructed and maintained anly as access to the public sireet.

Exception: The enforcing agency may waive or modify this requirement if in
his opinion such ali-weather hard-surfaced condition is not necessary in the
interest of public safety and welfare. - .

Section 503.2.1 is amended 16 read as follows:

503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstruct-

- -ed width of not less than 20 feet (6096 mim), exclusive of shoulders, except for

approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an unobstruct
ed vertical clearance of not less than 13 feet 6 inches (4115 mm). .

Section 503.2.2 is amended {o read as foIIoWs:

503.2.2 Authority: The fire code official shall have the authority to require or
permit modifications to the required access widths where they are inadequate
for fire or rescue operations or where necessary to meet the public safety
objectives of the jurisdiction. :

Section 503.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

. 503.2.3 Surface. Fire appératus access roads shall be designed and main-

10.

n.

12.

13.

14.

tained to support the imposed loads of fire apparatus and shall be surfaced so
as to provide all- weather driving capabilities.

Section 503.2.4 is amended to read as foliows:

'503.2.4 Turning radius. The required turning radius of a fire apparatus

access road shall be determined by the fire code official.

Section 503.2.5 is amended to read as follows:

503.2.5 Dead ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads in excesé of 150
feet (45,720 mm) in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning
around fire apparatus. .

Section 503.2.6 is amended to read as follows:

503.2.6 Bridges and elevated surfaces. Where a bridge or.an elevated sur-

“face is part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed

and maintained in accordance with AASHTO HB-17. Bridges and elevated
surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to.carry the imposed loads
of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to.
bridges where required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces
designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacent fo. surfaces that are not
designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs or both shall be
installed and maintained where required by the fire code official.

Section 503.2.7 is amended to read as follows:

503.2.7 Grade. The grade of the fire apparatus access road shall be within the

- {imits established by the fire code official based on the fire department’s appa-

15.

17.

ratus.
Section 503.2.8 is amended to read as follows:

503.2.8 Angles of approach and departure. The angles- of approach and
departure for fire apparatus access roads shall be within the limits established
by the fite code official based on the fire department’s apparatus.

Section 503.3 is amended to read as follows:

503.3 Marking. Where required by the fire code official, approved signs or
other approved notices or markings that include the words NO PARKING-
FIRE LANE shall be provided for fire. apparatus access roads to identify such
roads or prohibit the obstruction thereof. The means by which fire lanes are
designated shall be maintained in a clean and legible condition at all fimes
and be replaced or repaired when necessary to provide adequate visibility.

Section 503.4 is amended to read as follews: .

503.4 Obstruction of fire apparatus access roads. Fire apparatus access
roads shall not be ebstructed in any manrier, including the parking of vehicles.
The minimum widths and clearances established in Sections 503.2.1 and
503.2.2 shall be maintained at all times. .

Section 503.4.1 is amended'to read as follows:

503.4.1 Traffic calming devices. Traffic calming devices are prohibited
unless approved by the fire code official.

Section 503.5 is amended to read as follows:

503.5 Required gates or barricades. The fire code official iéyauthorized to
require the installation and maintenance of gates for other approved bari-

. cades across fire apparatus access roads, trails or other accessways, not

including public streets, alleys or highways: Electric gate operators, where pro-
vided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325. Gates intended for automatic
operation -shall be designed, constructed and installed to comply with the
requireients of ASTM F2200. ; .

Section 503.5.1 is amended to read as foliows:

503.5.1 Secured gates and barricades. Where required, gates and barri-
cades shall be secured in the approved manner. Roads, irails and other
accessways that have been closed and obstructed in the manner prescribed
by Section 503.5 shall not be trespassed on or used unless authorized by the

. owner and the fire code official.

19.

20.

Section 503.5.2 is amended td read as follows:

503.5.2 Fences and Gates. School grounds may be fenced, and gates there- ’

in may be. equipped with locks, provided that safe dispersal areas based on 3
square feet (0.28 m2) per occupant are located between the schoot and the
fence. Such required safe dispersal areas shall not-be located less than 50
feet (15,240 mm) from school buildings. : o

Every public and private school shall conform with Section 32020 of the Edu-
cation Code which states: .

The governing board of every school district,-and the goveming authority of -
" every private school, which maintains any building used for the instruction or

housing of school pupils on land entirely enclosed (except for building walls)
by fences or walls, shall, through cooperation with the local iaw enforcement
and fire protection agencies having jurisdiction of the area; make provision for
the erection of gates in such fences or walls. The gates shall be of sufficient
size to permit the entrance of the ambulances, police equipment, and firefight-
ing apparatus, used by the law enforcement and.fire protection agencies.
There shall be no less than one such access gate and there shall be as many.
such gates as needed to assure access fo alt major building and grounds

"areas. If such gates are to be equipped with Jocks, the focking devices shall

be designed to permit ready entrance by the use of the chain or bolt cuiting
devices wiﬂ'éwhich the local law enforcement and fire protection agencies may
be equipped. . .

-~ . Y

Section 503.6 is amendsd to read as follows:

503.6 Security gates. The installation of security gates across a fire appara-
tus access road shall be approved by the fire code official. Where security
qates are installed, they shali have an approved means of emergency opera-
tion. There security gates and-the emergency-operation shall be maintained
operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed
in accordance with UL 325..Gates intended for automatic operation shall be
designed, constructed and installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM
00. -

21.

27.

Section 505.1 is amended to read as follows:

505.1 Address identification. New and existing buildings shall be provided
with approved address identification. The address identification shall be legi-
ble and placed in a position that'is visible from the street or road fronting the
property, Address identification characters shall contrast with their back-
ground. Address numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters.
Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each character shall be not less than-4
inches (102 mm) high with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 inches (12.7 mm).
Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be provid-
ed in additional approved locations to facilitate emergency- response. Where
access is by means of a private road and the building cannot be viewed from-
the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or means shall be used to
identify the structure. Address identification shall be maintained.

22, Section 505.1.1 is added 1o read as follows:

505.1.1 Multiple tenant buildings. Multiple tenant spaces serviced by vehic-
ular access to the rear through any driveway, alleyway, or parking lot shall
have numbers or addresses placed prior to occupancy on all new and existing
buildings as to be plainly visible and-legible from the rear access way when
deemed necessary by the fire code official. Multiple tenant spaces serviced by
rear access through a corridor, exit court, or exit yard shall have approved
numbers or addresses displayed on the rear of the tenant space, when
deemed necessary by the fire code official.

‘Section 505.1.2 is added to read as follows:

505.1.2 Multiple tenant spaces. Multiple tenant spaces that front on interior
walkways or pedestrian malls shall have approved numbers or addresses
placed over the entrance door in all new and existing buildings. An illuminated
annunciator or directory board is required at every entrance where deemed
necessary by the fire code official. -

Section 505.1.3 is added to read as follows:

' 505.1.3 lllumination. Addressing shall be illuminated at night in all new build-
ings. Signs shall be.internally or externally illuminated. When the luminance or
the face of a sign is from an external source, it shall have an intensity of not
less than 5.0 foot-candles. Internally illuminated signs shall provide equivalent
luminance. In all cases, addresses shall be readily identifiable from the near-
est fire apparatus access road sarvicing the building. -

Section 506.1 is amended to read as follows:

506.1 Where required. Where access to or within a structure or an area is
restricted because of secured openings or where immediate access is neces-
sary for life-saving or fire-fighting purposes, the fire code official is authorized
to require a key box to be installed in.an approved location mountéd no higher
thar 5 feet (1524 mm) above grade. The key box shall be of an approved type -
listed in accordance with UL 1037, and shall contain keys to gain necessary
access as reduired by the fire code official. ‘ :

Section 507.5.1 is amended to read as follows:

507.5.1.Where required. Where any portion of the facility or building within
the jurisdiction is'more than 150 feet (457, 200 mm) from a water supply on a
~public street, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the
facility or building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the
required fire flow shall be provided when required by the fire code official.

Exception: For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, equipped
throughout with -an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with subsections 903.3.1.1, 908.3.1.2, or 903.3.1.3, the dis-
tance requirement shall be not more than 250 feet (76,200 mm).

- Section 511 is added to read as follows: -
SECTION 511 EMERGENCY ACCESS GATES & BARRIERS

511.1 Scope. Where a new gate or barrier is installed on a fire access road-
way, the fire department shall have emergency access. Gates or barriers shali
have a Click-2-Enter{¢) (Click2Enter) option for motorized gates and a Kriox(r)
pad lock or Knox(r) box (Knox) with appropriate keys for access to the prem-
ise. ' .

511.2 Definitions.

" GATES AND BARRIERS. A gé‘(e, crossbar, door or other obstructive device

that is utilized for the purpose of restricting, controlling of obstructing entry or
exit by motor vehicles or pedestrians to or from a private roadway and is not
monitored on a twenty four-hour, seven day per week basis by a person capa-
ble of providing immediate access to a police or fire safety vehicle or person.

PRIVATE DRIVEWAY. A private way for vehicular travel that provides access
from an off-street parking area to a public or private drive.

PRIVATE STREET OR ROADWAY. Any roadway (not dedicated as public.
right-of-way) that is owned -and maintained by abutling property owners or
association 6f property owners-and is utilized for the purpose of providing
vehicular or pedestrian access to a subdivision, apartment complex, condo-
miniums or other residential development or wildiand, excluding off-street
parking areas, driveways, and driveways to off-street parking areas. :

-511.3 Permit. A permit issued by the fire authority having jurisdiction is
required to install any secured access gate system. Applications to install
_gates or barriers shoild be submitted to the City of Sacramento, Fire Preven-
tion Division. Plans shall be approved by the fire authority and a permit issued
prior to installation. In addition to the required plans, the following documents
shall be submitted when required by the fire code official:

1. Written concurrence of property owners, in the form of a notarized let-
ter, indicating that all property owners served by the gate agree to the
installation and operation. :

2. ‘A notarized “"Road Maintenance Agreement” “identifying the addition
of the gates and operating systems.

The fire authority having jurisdiction shall inspect all gates for proper instalta-
tion and operation prior to activation or use.

511.4 Requirements for vehicle gates.

1.
2.

‘Al gates shall be UL 325 compliant.

- Gates shall not be installed within a required turning radius of a fire access
roadway. .

Access for single direction traffic shall be unobstructed 16 feet wide and 13
féet 6 inches (4115 mm) high. . ’ . .

Access for bi-directional traffic shall be unoi)structed 20 feet wide (6096 mm)
and 13 feet 6 inches (4115 mm) high.. ,

Swinging gates forsingle direction traffic shall sm}ing in the direction of vehicle
travel.

Swinging gates for bi-directional traffic shall swing into thé property being
entered. ‘ . :

All gates shall be accessible from the driving lane nearest the edge of the -
street by turning radii of at least 35 feet (10,668 mm) inside and 55 feet
(16,764 mm) outside. After passing through a gate; the nearest curb of any
cross street shall be no less than 40 feet (12,192 mm).

511.5 Operation of gates, éeneral. -

1.

Electrically operated gates shall be‘equipped with the foliowing abproved fire

department methods for entry and exit: -
a. - Key override switch (Knox), and
b.  Radio operated controller (Click2Enter or other approved equipment).

Exception: Radio controlled exit may be waived by installation of a “free
exit™ loop. '

Gates requiring radio-controlied access shalt be provided with an approved 2-
. inch by 2-inch (51 mmi by 51 mm), blue, reflective marker visible to approach-

" “ing traffic. It shall be located in the center of the exit gate.

a.  Wiring for elsctrical gates shall be provided by AC current, underground
‘instaffation. An electrical permit is required by-the Sacramento Building -
Department.

b. _Electrically operated gates shall fail to the open position when the power
is off. They shall remain open until power is restored.

c. Knox Company authorization forms are required for orders of key switch-
- es, boxes andpadlocks. The forms may be obtained by calling the Fire
Prevention Division. ) e - :

511.6 Manuat gatés or barriers. . |

1.

Manual gates or barriers may be approved on a case-by-case basis for night-
time security of business property or access to wildland property.

They shall be bonstructed in a manner that reflects good construction prac-
. tices acceptable to the fire authority having jurisdiction.

They shall be éccessible by means of an approved fire department padlock
(Knox) or by the installation of an approved key box (Knox). -~

Approved manual gates or barriers across emergency access roadways shall
be provided with an 18-gauge metal sign in the center and on both sides of
the gafe that shiall read; = FIRE LANE-NO PARKING.™ Letters shall be red on
a white background and be a minimum of 3 inches high (76mm) with a 1/2-
inch (12.7 mm) stroke. . .

For nighttime security only, gates to close off a fire-lane, in order to minimize
dumping and vandalism shall be approved with (Knox) padlock access. Gates
to be closed during business hours are required to be electronically operated.

511.7 Prohibitions.



ASACRAMENT_O BULLETIN AND SPECTRUM

MONDAY, AUGUST 7, 202

No gaée shall be instalied where access requires the use of a proximity reader
or card.

Direction-lim'rting devices, such as fixed tire spikes, are prohibited.

The total nurriber of vehicle access control devices or systems, through which
emergency vehicles must pass to reach any address shall not exceed one.

4. No commercial property owner-shalt install fences and gates where more
than one gate must be opened in order to reach within 150 feet (45,720 mm)
of the rear portion of any building.

511.8 Pedestrian gates.

1. Al vehicle gates obstructing pedestrian access to a public way (street) shall
have an approved pedestrian gate installed within 10 fest (3048 mm) of the
vehicle gate.

2. Gates shall be handicap accessible and comply with exit door requirements
of the 2013 California Building Code.

3. An approved key box (Kriox) shall be installed at least 48 inches (1220 mm)
above grade on the outside of the gate. It shall be provided with a key to open
the pedestrian gate.

4. No pedestrian gate shall be located in the median between two vehicle gates.

Exception: Private dri y
exempt from this requirement.

serving one single-family residence are

511.9 Additional requirements. Because of the delays caused by vehicle
access control devices or systems, additional fire protection requirements may
be appiied based on other access limitations, such as narrow .or winding
streets, or dead-end streets without an approved tumaround available for fire
apparatus. Other than the obstruiction and the reduced width controlled within
this standard, no other requirement of the fire authority having jurisdiction shall
be adversely affected by the placement of any vehicle access controt device
or system in ‘any required fire. apparatus access road. Fire depariment
approval does not waive any requirement by other authorities having jurisdic-

tion.
E. Chapter 6, Section 602.1, Definitions, is amended as follows:

1. The definition of ““roof access poiﬁts“ is added 1o read as follows:
ROOF ACCESS POINTS. An area that does not pléce ladders over openings
{i.e., windows or doors) and are located at strong points of building construc-
tion and in locations where it does not conflict with overhead obstructions such
as tree limbs, wires, or signs.

2. The definition of “"sloped roof*" is added to read as follows:

SLOPED ROOF. For the purpose of solar photovoltaic power systems, a rbof
with a greater than a 2-in-12 pitch.

3. The definition of “structural strong point™ is added to read as follows:

STRUCTURAL STRONG POINT. Bearing wall or other such suitable ioad
bearing member. '

F." - Chapter 9, Fire Protection and Life Safety Systems, is amended as follows:
1. Section 903.2 is amended to read as follows: )

'903.2 Where required. For all occupancies except Gfoup R-3 and detached U,
an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed and equipped with an electron-
ic monitoring system as follows:

1. In every new building where the total floor area exceeds 3,599‘ square
feet (1097 m2). .

2, An automatic fire sprinkier system shall be installed in every building
when there is an addition to the floor area in existence on the effective
date of this ordinance of 20 percent or more within a 12-ronth period and
'thg)aggregate floor area of the building exceeds 3,599 square feet (1097
m2). -

3. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed in any portion of a

building where there is a change of occupancy that creates a greater fire
or life safety hazard, and the floor area of that portion of the building,
which is changed, exceeds 3,599 square feet (1097 m2).

4. Forthe provisions of this Section, area separation walls shall not apply to
eliminate the installation of a sprinkler system.

Exception: Non-combustible, detached canopies open on four sides
not exceeding the basic allowable square footage in CBC Table 503
used exclusively for the parking or storage of private or pleasure
vehicles and noncoribustible storage (includes fuel islands).

2. Section 903.2.11.7 is added to read as follows:

903.2.11.7 Covered floats, marinas and piers. A fire sprinkler sys'tém shall be
provided for all covered floats, marinas, piers, and any/all other covered float-
ing structures that are commercially operated and exceeds 3,599 square feet
(1097 m2). - .

3. Section 903.3.1.3 is amended to read as follows:

903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems

*installed in one- and two- family dwellings and townhousés are permitted to be
installed throughout in aceordance with NFPA 13D and the City of Sacramento
standards. Every submittal shall include a'full set of plans including details of
type of pipe and fittings, hydraulic calculations, elevation views of all potential
models if site is a master planned community and any other requested data
sheets.

4. Section 803.3.8.4 is amended to read as follows:

903.3.8.4 Subervision.- Control valves shall ot be installed between the water
supply and sprinklers uniess the valves are of an approved indicating type that
are supervised or secured in the open position.

Section 903.4.1.1 is added to read as following:

903.4.1.1 Fire controi room. An approved fire control room shall be provided
for all new buildings or occupancies with a change of use, protected by an
automatic fire extinguishing system. The room shall contain all system control
valves, fire alarm control panels and other fire equipment required by the fire

code official. Fire control rooms shall be located within the building at a location

approved by the fire code official and shall be provided with a means to access
the room directly from the exterior. Durable signage shall be providec on the
exterior side of the access door to identify the fire control room. Fire Control
Rooms shall not be less than 50 square feet (15.24 m2).

Exceptions: - ’

1. Group R, Division 3, Occupancies.

2. Occupancies with a fire pump shall have a fire control room
that is a minimum of 200 square feet (61 m2).

3. In highrise buildings, the fire control room shall not be les:
than 200 square feet (61 m2). .

6. Section.907.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.3 Group E. Group E Occupancies shall be provided with fire alarm sys-

tems in accordance with Section 907.2.3. Group E Occupancies having an
occupant load of 50 or more, shall be provided with an approved automatic fire

alarm system. When automatic sprinkler systems or smoke detectors are -

ingtalled, such systems or detectors shall be connected to the building fire
alarm system. When more than one fire alarm control unit is used, they shall
be interconnected and shall operate all indicating devices. Group E Occupan-
cies with an occupant load of 50 persons or less shall have an early-warning
device as approved by the fire authority having jurisdiction.

7. Section 907.6.6 is amended to read as follows:

Section 907.6.6 Monitoring. Required alarm systems shall be monitored by
an approved alarm servics provider's Type A (listed) Central Station as estab:
lished by Sacramento Regional Fire/EMS Communication Center. B

The Central Station monitoring company or approved alarm company shall
notify the authority having jurisdiction in writing, within 24 hours, of systems
that are found not to be in compliance with applicable codes.

Receipt of supervisory signals by the monitoring company require the dis-
patch of a runner or maintenance psrson -{arrival fime not to exceed 3 hours),
ufr;less the. condition can be restored to normal through the subscriber’s
efforts. - :

Exception: Monitoring by a supervising station is not required for:

1. Single and multiple-station smoke alarms required by Section
907.2.11. o

2. Group 1-3 occupancies shall be monitored in-accordance with
Section 807.2.11. B :

3. Automatic sprinkler systems in one- and two-family dweltings.

8. - Section 907.6.6(A) is added to read as foliows:

907.6.6(A) Branch electrical circuits. When providing a fire alarm circuit in a
multiple-occupancy type building (muttiple metering), the circuit shail be ener-
ized from the building meter panel board. When a separate source of power
i.e., emergency generator) is provided, the fire alarm circuit shall be ener-
gized from the emergency panel board. : ’

9. Section 907.6.6(B) is added toread as follows: -

907.6.6(B) Alarm transmission. The activation of a fire sprinkler-system,
hood extinguishing system, special extinguishing system or a fire alarm/detec-

10. -

tion system shall cause the system to initiate a signal to the Central Station
within 90 seconds. Retransmission from the Central Station {0 the Fire Dis-
patch Center shall not exceed 60 seconds,

. - Exception: Hood egdipguishihg systems or speciélrextinguishing sys-
Eams instalféi in existing buildings without a fire alarm system need not
e monitored. : .

Section 907.6.6(C).is added to read as follows:

907.6.6(C) Signal interference. Signal amplification is required to provide sig-
nal integrity at the discretion- of the fire code official. Ali costs regarding the
installation, maintenance, and continuous operation of these lines of transmis-
sion are the responsibility of the building owner. .

Section 907.6.6.1 is amended to read as follows: N
907.6.6.1 Automatic telephoné dialing devices. Two separate telephone
lines (numbers) that use Digital Alarm Communicator Transmitters (DACT)
shall be provided from the protected premises 1o the Central Station. All costs
regarding the installation, maintenance, and continuous operation of those

~lines are the responsibility of the building owner.

G. Chapter 11, Construction Requiremeénts for Existing Buildings, ié amended as follows:

1.

Section 1101.3 is added to read as follows:

1101.3. Permits. Permits are required as set forth in Sections 105.5 and 105.6
and the California Building Code.

Section 1101.3.1 Is added to read as follows:

~ -
1101.3.1 Helicopter use permits. A permit is reqguired for any person, firm or.
business landing a helicopter at a site other than an approved airport or heli-
portt as described by Federal Aviation Administration F.A.R. Part 77, for the
purpose of advertising, promotians, fifting, or rides whetheér for public or pri-
vate use. The fire code official is-authorized to issue permits for these uses in

- accordance with the provisions in section 105 permits. In addition o any other

information that the fire code official may require under Section-105.2 Applica-
tion, sufficient information shall be provided to the fire code official to allow him
or her to reasonably determine or assess the operational safety of the use.

H. Section 2006.5.1.4, is added to read as follows:

2006.5.1.4 Fueling at rooftop heliports. Refueling at rooftop heliports,

helistops or emergency landing areas is prohibited.
N —~

L. Section 2603.3, is added to read as foffows:

2603.3 Notification. The fire code official and fire chief shall be notified in
writing not less than 48 hours before the building, structure or space is to be
closed in connection with the utilization of any toxic or flammable fumigant.
Notification shalf give the location of the enclosed space to be fumigated or
fogged, the occupancy, the fumigants or insecticides to be utllized, the person
or persons responsibie for the operation, and the date and time at which the

“.operation will begin. Written notice of any fumigation or insecticidal fogging
operation shall be given to all affected occupants of the building, structure or
space in which such operations are to be conducted with sufficient advance
notice to allow the occupants to evacuate the building, structure or space.
Such notice shall inform the occupants as to the purposes, anticipated dura-
tion and hazards associated with the fumigation or insecticidal fogging oper-
ation. advanced notice to the occupants of the enclosed space involved to
enable the occupants to evacuate the premises. . .

J.  Chapter 58, Explosives and Fireworks, is amended as follows:

1.

Section 5601.2 is added to read as follows:

5601.2 Permit required. Permits are required as set forth in Section 105.5 and
regulated in accordance with this section, and are required for the sale and dis-

. -play of " Safe and Sane™ approved fireworks as permitted and reguiated by

Chapter 8.48 of the Sacramento City Code.
Section 5601.7 is added to read as follows:

5601.7 ‘éeizufé. The fife code official is-authorized-to-seize;take, remove or
cause to be removed at the expense of the owner all stocks of fireworks offered

" or exposed for sale, stored or held in violation of local, state, or federai regula-

tions.

K. Section 5704.2.14.1, is amended to read as foliows:

5704.2.14.1 Removal. Tanks shall not be disassembled at the site by any
means.

L. The National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) standards in Chapter 80, Refer-
enced Standards, are amended to read as follows: / ’ , )

NFPA - National Fire Protection Association

All NFPA Standards current as of the date of this code’s adoption are adopted except:
11C, 13E, 297, 473, 550, 902, 1001,.1002, 1003, 1021, 1031, 1033, 1035, 1041,
1201, 1221, 1402, 1404, 1405, 1410, 1500, 1561, 1581, 1710, 1720, 1801, 1911,
1914, 1931,.1932, 1971, 1975, 1981, 1982, 1983, 1999.

M. -Appen‘dix C, Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution, is amended as follows:

1.

Section G104.2 is added to read as follows:

c104.2 Ekisting single outlet 2 1/2<inch (83.5-mm) hydrants. Existing single- -

outlet 21/2-inch (63.5-mim) hydrants shall be changed to an approved steam-
er-style hydrant, when construction or use increases the required fire flow.

- Section C104.3 is added to read aé follows:

€104.3 Water main improvements. Wherée water méinAimprovements. are
required to meet gallon per minute (gpm) flow, and the existing water main has
a sir}glz 2 1/2-inch (63.5-mm) outist fire hydrant, an upgrade of hydrants is
required. _ -

| Section C104.4 is.added to read as follows:

€104.4 Existing hydrants. Existing hydrants affected by right-of-way improve-
ments shall be moved to an approved location at no cost to the fire-authority.

Section C104.5 is added to read as follows:

C104.5 Hydrant type. The fire code official shall approve the type of fire'
hydrants to be installed in public right-of-way or on private property prior to any’

such installation under the City Utilities Standard.

N. Appendix CC, Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution, is amended as follows:

"1. Table CC105.1 is amended fo read as follows: -

TABLE NO. CC105.1 e
NUMBER AND DISTRIBUTION OF FIRE HYDRANTS f

FIRE FLOWMNINIMUM VERAGE - MAXIMUM  DISTANCE
REQUIREMENT NUMBER OFSPACING FROMHYDRANT TO ANY]
(gpm)c HYDRANTS  [BETWEEN POINT ON. STREET OR
. -HYDRANTS * & 4/ROADWAY FRONTAGE
e . Ft.)
(Ft.) 1 ) .
1750 or less |1 1360 (91,440 mm) [150 (45,720-mm)
2000-2250 2 300 (91,440 mm) [150.(45,720 mm)
P500-3250 3 300 (91,440 mm) [150 (45,720 mm)
35004250 & ~1300 (61,440 mm) [150 (45,720 mm)
4500-5250 5 (300 (81,440 mm) [150 (45,720 mm)
5500-5750 5 T [300 (91,440 mm) |150 (45,720 mm)
- 1B000-6250 5 D50 (76,200 mm) [150 (45,720 mm)
" 5007250 7 550 (76,200 mm) [150 (45,720 mim)

[7500 or more

I8 or more

The adoption of this ordinance is not intended to and does not affect an
administrative, civil, criminal, or other actions or proceedings brought or to bi
brought to implement or enforce any provisions of the Sacramento City Code
as they existed prior to the effective date-of this ordinance, including but nc
limited to any actions or proceedings to enforce the 2019 California Fire Code
as locally amended, under the provisions of Chapter 15.36 of the Sacrament
- City Codg, as they existed prior to the effective date of this ordinance. The pro

visions of the Sacramento City Code as they exist prior to the effective date c
this ordinance shall continue to be operative and effective with regard to an

such actions or proceedings.
SECTION 4. Emergenpy Declaration

The city council declares this ordinance to be an emergency measure, to take effect imme
diately upon its adoption pursuant to Sacramento City Charter section 32(g)(2). The fact

constituting the emergercy are as follows:

The Sacraments Fire Department has responded to over 1,500 grass or vegetation fire

. from open burns since January 1, 2023. Such fires are a direct health and safety risk t

members of the public. Fires from open burns have also caused damage to the city’s vite
infrastructure, such as levees, bridges, and waterways. Requiring operational permits o
open burns on public property and on. private property in the absence of permission fron
the lessee or property owner is immediately necessary to protect the heaith and safety ¢

the public.

Adopted by the City of Sacramento City Council on Aﬁgust 1, 2023, by the following vote

Ayes:
Vang, and Mayor Steinberg
Noes:  Nome
Abstain: None
Absent:  None
Attest:

. Members Guerra, Jennings, Kaplan, Maple, Loloee, Talamantes; Valenzuels

s )
Mindy Cuppy, City Clerk

The presence of an elecironic signature certifies that the foregoing is a true and correc
copy as approved by the Sacramento City Gouncil. :

CN998969 PO71367 Aug 7, 2023
FERTEN THILR AR ERIVN LR RS0 00 1B

ORDINANCE 2023-0015
Adopted by the Sacramento City Council
August 1, 2023

An Ordinance Authorizing the City
Manager to implement a Temporary
Shelter Program

BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF
THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO: .

SECTION 1.
The city council finds the following:

A. According to the 2022 Point in Time
Count conducted by Sacramento Steps
Forward, the estimated number of people
living in tents and vehicles in the City and
the County of Sacramento totaled 6,664, a
71% increase from 2019. Of these 6,664,
an estimated 67%, or 4,444 people, were
camping in the City of Sacramento. Partici-
pants in the Point in Time Count tallied
1,600 tents in the City and the County, a
four-fold increase from the-2019 count.

B. The City of Sacramento has increased
the number of spaces it operates in shel-
ters, motels, tiny homes, safe parking lots,
and safe camping sites from less than 100
six years ago to more than 1,100 today.

C. In December 2022, the City and the
County of Sacramento adopted a partner-
ship agreement that, in addition to other
provisions;, requires the County to open at
least 200 additional shelter beds in the City
limits if the City provides shovel-ready
sites.

D. The City and County are currently work-
ing in partnership to find sites for and open
350’ tiny homes pledged by the State of
Catifornia to the City. .

E. Until these facilities open, the City is lim-
ited in its ability fo reduce the size of
encampments because nearly all the shel-
ter beds operated by the County and City
are gccupied. . :

F. Giving the City Manager the unilateral
authority to impiement a temporary shelter
program, including the authority to identify
sites, adjust the budget, and execute
agreements; would help ensure new tem-
porary shelter spaces are thoroughly vet-
ted and quickly created.

SECTION 2.

Notwithstanding any provision to the con-
trary in the Sacramento City Code, the City
Manager, or the City Manager's designee,
is hereby given full authority to do all things
necessary and convenient to establish new
temporary shelter spaces necessary 1o
make a visible and tangible difference on

" the streets of Sacramento, including but
. not limited to safe ground camping sites

and motel rooms. This includes the author-,
ity to do the following: -

a) Adjust revenue and expenditure budgets
related to all funds received by the City in
support of this temporary shelter program
from any source, including the Sacramento
Housing and Redevelopment Agency
(SHRA); the federal, state, and county gov-
ernments; and any other public or private
sourceé. - : :

b) Make interdepartmental transfers relat-
ed to this program.

¢} Make financial appropriation changes
and transfers of $250,000 or more neces-
sary to implement and administer this pro-
gram without City Council approval. ’

d) Execute any agreemént up to $5 million
necessary fo implement. and administer
this program, subject to approval as to form
by the City. Attorney, without complying.
with the competitive bidding procedures in
Title 3 of the Sacramento City Code and
without obtaining specific authorization by
the Gity Council. :

SECTION 3. -

00 (60,960 mm) [120 (36,576 mim) |

For SI: 1 foot. =304.8 mm, 1 gallon gef minute = 3.785 L/m

ii.

‘Reduce by 100 feet (30,480 mm) for dead-end streets or roadways.

Hydrants are required on both sides of the strest whenevef one or more of the

following conditions exist:

Street has a median center divider that makes. access to hydrants difficult,

causes a time delay, or creates an undue hazard;
There are four or more lanes of traffic; : .
Width of the sirest is in excess of 88 feet (26,822 mm); or

The existing street will be widened or will have a raised median center divider
installed in the future pursuant to the General Plan Roadway Improvement
Plans for the City of Sacramenio.

Orie hydrant for each 1,000 gpm ‘or fraction thereof.

Where new water mains are extended along streets where hydrants are not
needed for. protection of structures or simiiar fire problems, fire hydrants should
be provided every 1,000 feet (304,800 mm{ of street o provide for transporta-
tion hazards. In addition, there shall be at ieast one hydrant at each intersec-
tion. : S

Average spacing between hydrants may be extended to 500 (152,400 mm) feet
on streéts serving one- and two-family dwellings.’ .

The fire code official is authorized to modify the location, number and distribu- .
" tion of the fire hydrants, based on site-specific constraints hazards. }

15.36.060 Adoption of ordinance.

To imple;nent and administer the tempo-
rary shelter program specified in this ordi-
nance, the City Manager or the City Man-

ager's designge may perform any of the--

functions specified in CEQA. Guideline
Section 15025, subdivision (@).

Adopted by the City of Sacramento City
Council on August 1,:2023, by the follow-

. _ing vote:
Ayes:  Members Guerra, Jennings,
. Maple, Loloee, and Mayor
Steinberg
Noes: = Members Kaplan, Talamantes,
Valenzuela, and Vang ’
Abstain: None
. Absent: None
Attest:

s/, R
Mindy Cuppy, City Clerk

The presence of an electronic signature
certifies that the foregoing is a true and
correct copy as approved by the Sacra-
mento City Council. ’

Passed for Publication: Not Applicable
Published: To be published in its entirety

per Crty Charter Séction 32(d).

* Effective: August 31, 2023

CN998968 PO71367 Aug 7, 2023
LIERIER IR0 DRI TRESR RRAUN RUGRY 1REY 1N

-NOTICE AND ORDER TO CLEAN,
REMCVE, REPAIR AND/OR CEASE
A PUBLIC NUISANCE

TO: All.Owners and Beneficiaries Liste
Below: C.

1. You are being notified as Record Owne
and/or Beneficiary that the Code Enforce
ment Manager, Nesighborhood Cod
Enforcement Division of the Code Enforce

. ment Department, has caused to b

inspected and has determined that th
property. is creating a public nuisance cor
dition under the provisions of Title 8 of th
Sacramento City Code. C

2. That the -conditions which render th
property a public nuisance under are se
forth on the attached list of existing viole
tions. .

3. The Code Enforcement Manager ha
determined that the violations on subje:

*_property must be corrected.

" 4. 1f you elect to correct the violations, th

work therefore shall- commence within 1
days from the date of this Order and con
pleted within 30 days from the date of th
order. h

5.You are further noﬁfied that if the correc
tions are not commenced andfor comple

- ed within the specified time, the Cod

Enforcement Manager: (1) .may asses
Administrative Penalty; (2) may seek a
Inspection/abatement warrant to bring th
property into compliance; and {(3) may sul
mit this maitter Superior Gourt for injunctiv
relief. All costs shall be charged again:
the property or against you as the owner.

6. You are further notified that any perso
having any record title or legal interest |
the property may appeal this Notice an
Order or any action of the Gode Enforc
ment Manager to the Code Enforcemen
Appeals Hearing Examiner, the appe:
must be filed with the Code Enforcemer
Manager within 30 days from the date «
this Notice and Order, and that failure 1
appeal will constitute a waiver of all righ
to an_administrative hearing and determ
nation of the matter, An_appeal fee
$400.00 is required at the time of th
_appeal reguest. Unless an appeal is filex

“the Code Enforcement Manager will pr

ceed to an inspection/abatement warral
and/or injunctive’ relief without furthe
notice to you. .

Record Qwner/Other Owners or Benefic

aries/Property Address/APN #/Correctior

1. Name of Owner:

CAZARES CARLOS PALACIOS/ONELI
PALACIOS ANY HEIRS AND BENEFIC
ARIES . E

7961 ORENZA WAY

SACRAMENTO, CA 85823

APN: 119-0324-001-0000

2. BENEFICIARIES:
N/A

This is a property which violates the Nt

sance Code, Chapter 8 Article: C03: SC

8.04.100 E; C08: SCC 17.612 and 'CO

-8§€C 17.612. - . .

- CN998806 PO71749 Jul 31, Aug 7,14,
023 o

1 RSO O G BRSO O

File No. FENF2023-05090
* FICTITIOUS BUSINESS
: NAME STATEMENT
(1) 2554 26th Ave Sacramento, CA 9583
County of Sacramento
(2; MARTHA FRANCO CLEANERS

3) MARTHA FRANCO 2554 26th A
acramento, CA 95838 -
(4) This business conducied by: an indivi

ual B
(5) Date began using business nam

23.
Described the type of Activities/Busines
Cleanin .
(6) | deciare that all information in th
statemet is irue and correct. (A registral
who declares as true information whig
they know to be false is guilty of a crime.
Signed: Martha Franco =~
Printed Name: MARTHA FRANCO
In accordance with Section 17820(a),

_ Fictitious' Business. Name Statement ge
erally expires five years from the date
was filed with the County Clerk, except
provided in Section 17920(b), where
expires 40 days after any change in it
facts set forth in the statement pursuant
section 17913 other than a change in i
residence address of a registered owner.
new Fictitious Business Name Stateme
must be filed before the expiration.

The fiting of this Statement does not
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fi
titious Business Name in violation of 1l
rights of another under Federal, State,
common law (section 14411 et seq., of
Business and Professions Code).

This Statement was filed with' the Coun
Clerk of Sacramento on July 5, 2023.
Expires: July 4, 2028

-1 hereby certify that this copy is a corre
c?f?y‘of the original Statement on file in
office. °

DONNA . ALLRED, SACRAMENT
COUNTY CLERK -
By:, Deputy County Clerk
CN996559 Jul 24,31, Aug 7,14, 2023
FIRMIEW SRET \OG ILR OEIE AT 08EL 1REL




